Selections:	Results:			
9 Leo - vied 3w,led,run down	Results:	9	\$10.20 \$3.80	\$2.40
3 Alluring American - vied inside, weakened,		3	\$2.60	
2 Private Boone - gave way inside uppr		5		\$2.40
7 Moonline -		7		
			Ex: \$12.30 Tri:	\$16.75
Fuzzyla Hanco Dickla Conveight 2002				
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 2 at BTP (CLM 1m 9100) on May 17, 20	10			
======================================		====	:=========	=======
Selections:	Results:			
4 Pebble Slinger - close-up erly,drop bck		4	\$4.20 \$3.00	
1 Love Yamari - led to str, no match		2	\$11.20	
2 Rose of Prado - never a real factor		1		\$2.10
6 Toast the Bulldogs - well placed, faded		6	Ex: \$23.70 Tri:	¢28 20
			LX. \$25.70 III.	\$20.20
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003				
Report for Race # 3 at BTP (CLM 6f 12700) on May 17, 2	<b>719</b>			
Selections:	Results:	_	to co to co	do 40
3 Love Strut - drew off, ridden out,		3		
1 The Lady Factor - vied between to turn		1A 6		
1A Ohio Dreamin - faded on the turn 6 Totheend - all pace, well clear		5		\$5.20
o Totheena - all pate, well clear		,	Ex: \$28.30 Tri:	\$91.75
			EX. \$20.502.	452175
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003				
Report for Race # 4 at BTP (CLM 1m 9100) on May 17, 20				
				=======
C-1+i	D14			
Selections:	Results:	_	¢22 00 ¢0 20	dr 20
4 Tizaboutime - middle move, empty 7 Son Will - angled out, rallied		6 1	\$23.80 \$9.20 \$5.40	
5 Swami Genius - pace, headed/no match		4		\$2.60
8 Scouting - wide 1/4p glided clear		7		<b>\$2.00</b>
, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,			Ex: \$87.30 Tri:	\$171.35
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003				
Report for Race # 5 at BTP (ALW 1m 17400) on May 17, 2	<b>719</b>			
Selections:	Results:			
Selections: 6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider	Results:		\$16.60 \$8.80	\$5.80
Selections: 6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back	Results:	7 6	\$16.60 \$8.80 \$19.20	
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider	Results:	7	\$19.20	
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back	Results:	7 6	\$19.20	\$8.60
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded	Results:	7 6 3	\$19.20	\$8.60 \$2.60
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded	Results:	7 6 3	\$19.20	\$8.60 \$2.60
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,	Results:	7 6 3	\$19.20	\$8.60 \$2.60
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered, Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003		7 6 3	\$19.20	\$8.60 \$2.60
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered, Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor	19	7 6 3 5 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45  \$16.00
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19	7 6 3 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor	19	7 6 3 5 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor	19	7 6 3 5 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid	19	7 6 3 5 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19  Results:	7 6 3 5 5	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri: \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed, duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at BTP (ALW 1 1/16 27500) on May 1	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed, duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at BTP (ALW 1 1/16 27500) on May 1	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20:	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at BTP (ALW 1 1/16 27500) on May 1  Selections: 6 Over Icce - late brust, drew off	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40 \$2,069.6
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at BTP (ALW 1 1/16 27500) on May 1  Selections: 6 Over Icce - late brust, drew off 3 Mo Dont No - 3w-run, held at bay	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:  \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.20	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40 \$2,069.6
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:  \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.20	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40 \$2,069.6
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20  Selections: 7 Quest Approval - pace, grudgingly late 3 Rufeelinglucky - void speed, wide run 6 Count Archibald - never a factor 5 Right On Munich - raced evenly, no bid  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at BTP (ALW 1 1/16 27500) on May 1  Selections: 6 Over Icce - late brust, drew off 3 Mo Dont No - 3w-run, held at bay	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:  \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.20	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40 \$2,069.6 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.20 \$2.10
6 El Rubio - in tight, lost rider 3 Albireo - rushed,duel, came back 7 Hallelujah Hawk - pulled to half, faded 2 Seventy Seventycat - pressed 1/2, faltered,  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at BTP (MDN 1m 8000) on May 17, 20	19 Results: 7, 2019	7 6 3 5 5 8 9 6 7	\$19.20 Ex: \$166.90 Tri:  \$123.00 \$54.20 \$9.80 Ex: \$663.30 Tri:  \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.20	\$8.60 \$2.60 \$441.45 \$16.00 \$6.20 \$7.40 \$2,069.6 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.20 \$2.10

Report for Race # 8 at BTP (ALW 6f 24700) on May 17, 2019

- Selections:
  4 Mep inside run, much best
  1 Woodys Watchin sharp pace caught late
  8 Sole Factor bid abreast, cleared
  2 Baby Nina shut off mid stretch

Results:

10 \$55.40 \$12.00 \$11.20
4 \$3.00 \$2.20
2 \$2.40
8
Fx: \$86.80 Tri: \$126.35

Ex: \$86.80 Tri: \$126.35