Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 1 at EMD (CLM 5%f 6400) on April 28, 2019

Selections: Results:
4 Trelawny - 4w2ndturn,bid3/16,clr

1 Ryan Walt - inside,steady bid

2 Blackford - 5w-both turns, no bid

3 Ask Not - angled out3/16,no bid

$19.20 $8.60 $3.80
$8.20 $4.20
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Ex: $58.80 Tri: $99.95

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 2 at EMD (MDN 5f 11000) on April 28, 2019

Selections: Results:
3 Waisiliva - off slow,lagged,no bid 7 $21.60 $9.00 $4.60
6 Billyinthefridge - 3 $3.60 $2.60
2 Rosies Gift - 5w-turn, no threat 5 $4.60
1 Preachinsnowinrio - 2

Ex: $39.30 Tri: $91.00
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 3 at EMD (CLM 5J\f 6400) on April 28, 2019
Selections: Results:
5 Endangered - 5w2ndturn,angld outl/4 1 $4.20 $2.60 $2.20
4 Affluent Asset - rated,no rally 7 $3.40 $3.00
1 Mr. Jay D - set close,late rush 3 $4.40
2 Pocket Prince - fanned 3w, no rally 6

Ex: $8.50 Tri: $20.90
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 4 at EMD (CLM 5J4f 6800) on April 28, 2019
Selections: Results:
5 E Z Star Maker - hustled,clear,handily 5 $3.00 $2.20 $2.10
3 Brooks Harbor - 3w-pace, handily 7 $6.60  $3.80
4 True Statatement - set pace,gaveway 6 $3.80
6 Pepper Chrome - trailed,gained 1

Ex: $7.00 Tri: $21.85
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 5 at EMD (MDN 5%f 18500) on April 28, 2019
Selections: Results:
1 Goldslinger - pressed3w, bid 3/16 2 $64.60 $26.80 $12.20
3 Battle Point Red - bumped start,5w-turn 4 $20.00 $8.80
5 Why Not Us - angled in 1/4,no bid 3 $5.60
6 Zippin Wine - bump st,droppd back3/8 5

Ex: $233.40 Tri: $966.80
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 6 at EMD (CLM 5Xf 11200) on April 28, 2019
Selections: Results:
5 Beau Rocks - tracked pace, no rally 6 $37.40 $16.20 $7.60
4 Sugarseeker - bumpd st,angled outl/8 7 $7.00 $4.20
3 Hold That Smile - set pace, gave way 3 $3.60
7 Spot On - 5w2ndturn, weakened 5

Ex: $113.30 Tri: $355.65
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 7 at EMD (ALW 54f 11200) on April 28, 2019
Selections: Results:
7 Goldie's Darlins - split horses, gaining 5 $8.00 $4.20 $2.60
1 Easter Dream - inside,btwn foes wire 4 $11.20 $3.60
3 Tesla - Sw-turn, steady bid 1 $2.10
5 Getting Joellenned - vied between, tired 7

Ex: $43.50 Tri: $49.65

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003



Report for Race # 8 at EMD (ALW 5Xf 18500)

Selections:
2 Elliott Bay - 4w2ndturn,angled in1/8 8 $7.00 $3.80 $2.60
7 Cody's Choice - 4w-pace,driftedl/4 7 $4.80 $3.40
1 Hit the Beach - inside bid1/8, clear 2 $4.00
8 Awhitesportscoat - pressed 2w, weakened 1

Ex: $15.60 Tri: $41.10
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at EMD (MDN 5Xf 7800)
Selections:
2 Johnny Five - off slow, rushed up 5 $14.00 $7.20 $4.20
1 Mister G. Q. - saved ground, no rally 4 $11.40 $6.40
6 Devil Dog - bumped start,no menace 6 $3.20
5 Docktarri - broke through gate 2

Ex: $67.80 Tri: $114.45



