Selections:	Results:		
1 Persistence - pace early, weakened			\$5.60 \$2.60 \$2.40
3 Paitaska - pace rail,cght,wknd		5	
5 Camp Counselor - bid 2w,dueled,svd 2d		6	
4 Hawk's Rising - no speed		3	
0			Ex: \$5.40 Tri: \$12.25
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 2 at GG (CLM 1 1/16 20000) on May 11,	2019		
Selections:	Results:		
1 Coastal Starlite - brk slw,4w,rallied,nod			\$7.80 \$4.20 \$3.00
4 Waverly Way - bid 2w,battled,nod		4	
3 Secret Wind - pace 2w,stayed,tired		2	\$3.20
5 Desert Trip - erratic early,no rally		6	- 444 CO T : 404 45
			Ex: \$11.60 Tri: \$21.15
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 3 at GG (MDN 4%f 30000) on May 11, 20	19		
Selections:	Results:		
1 Izzy's Input -	MCSGICS!	4	\$3.40 \$2.40 \$2.10
4 Bulletproof One -		5	
2 Gobarrybarry -		3	
3 Miss Swiss -		1	43.00
		_	Ex: \$5.30 Tri: \$9.20
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 4 at GG (ALW 1m 19000) on May 11, 201	9		
		====	
Selections:	Results:		
7 Imminent - pace rail, tired			\$7.60 \$4.80 \$4.00
5 Love Solution - bid 2-3w,clear drvng		2	\$6.00 \$4.80
4 Papaya - prssd 3w,dueled,cght		6	\$5.40
3 Hi Skool Sweethart - roused 2w, no threat		1	
			Ex: \$17.20 Tri: \$73.45
Fuzzy's Hansa Disk's Commisht 2002			
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	10		
Report for Race # 5 at GG (ALW 5%f 19000) on May 11, 20	15		
	Results:	====	
Selections:	Results:		\$10.40 \$5.00 \$2.60
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane	Results:	5	
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd	Results:	5 4	\$10.20 \$4.00
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid	Results:	5	\$10.20 \$4.00
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd	Results:	5 4 6	\$10.20 \$4.00
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid	Results:	5 4 6	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd	Results:	5 4 6	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003		5 4 6	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly	9	5 4 6 2 7 2 5	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat	9	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly	9	5 4 6 2 7 2 5	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly	9	5 4 6 2 7 2 5	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally	9	5 4 6 2 7 2 5	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly	9 ======= Results:	5 4 6 2 7 2 5	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9 ====== Results:	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201	9 ====== Results:	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201	9 ====== Results:	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201 Selections:	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - presd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05
Selections: 1 Untouched Elegance - fought back rail lane 6 Our Bold Princess - prssd,bid 2w,led,wknd 5 Big Base - 3w,forced 6w,no bid 2 Winsinfashion - inside,held 3rd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at GG (MDN 5f 39000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 6 Simply Perfect - pace 2w, weakened 1 Aleda Lutz - 2wide, no threat 5 Rolinga - pace 3w,outkckd,evenly 7 Jaimi James - saved ground, no rally Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at GG (CLM 1m 10000) on May 11, 201 Selections: 4 Lil Awecim - asked 3w, lost punch 1 War Union - broke slow, outrun 3 If I Had a Nickel - roused 3w,even late	9 ====================================	5 4 6 2 7 2 5 1	\$10.20 \$4.00 \$2.20 Ex: \$42.60 Tri: \$43.80 \$8.60 \$6.00 \$3.20 \$12.20 \$6.20 \$3.60 Ex: \$52.30 Tri: \$194.05

Selections:	Results:	
1 Acclaim the Queen - bid rail, outfinished	6 \$7.80 \$4.60 \$3.00	
7 Oursensationalgirl - pace rail, tired	7 \$5.40 \$3.60	
8 Becomes a Queen - asked 2-3w, no threat	3 \$2.20	
3 Check Six - pace 2w,dug in,tagged	4	
	Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$24.45	5

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at GG (MDN 1m 10000) on May 11, 2019

Sel		

Selections:
7 When Jesus Walked - prssd 2w,bid,svd 2d
5 Redneck Stranger - shifted 2w, rallied
1 Aerial Decoy - pace rail,stayed,wknd
9 Planet Nine - fanned 4w, no rally

Results:

4 \$85.40 \$19.80 \$9.00 7 \$3.40 \$2.40 5 \$3.60

Ex: \$143.50 Tri: \$336.40