Report for Race # 1 at LS (ALW 6+ 28000) on May 12, 201	9					
				=====		===
Selections:	Dogulto.					
	Results:	•	<i>t.</i> 00 <i>t</i> 0		+ 2 4 2	
2 Glory Stars - shifted 4w, late surge		2	\$4.80 \$2.		\$2.10	
1 Minister of Soul - 4w1st turn, stopped		6	\$3.		\$2.60	
6 Direct Dial - 3w, rallied, much best		1			\$2.20	
4 He's So Zazzy - tracked rail, came out		3				
		E	x: \$19.80	Tri:	\$7.30	
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003						
Report for Race # 2 at LS (MDN 6f 11000) on May 12, 201	9					
				=====		===
Selections:	Results:					
1 Mesquite Bean - 4-5path turns, no rally		3	\$3.40 \$2.	40 5	\$2.10	
3 Mary Jane's Double - tight brk,urged inside		2	\$4.	60 5	\$2.40	
2 Doc's Denita - 2path turn, no rally		4			\$2.10	
4 Golden Paree - awkward brk,4-5wd trip		1				
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			x: \$11.80	Tri: '	\$4.95	
		_	X. 411.00		,	
Fuzzy's Honse Dick's Copyright 2002						
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	10					
Report for Race # 3 at LS (CLM 5½f 12000) on May 12, 20						
	=======		=======	_====		-==
Colortions	Dog.:34					
Selections:	Results:					
6 Kennedell - tracked btw,shifted4wd					\$2.10	
3 Western Maid - ins-2p,3p3/16,drft out		4	\$2.	40	\$2.10	
4 More Than a Melody - outside, 3wide turn		3		:	\$3.80	
5 Fifteen Golden - tkn up bit after start		5				
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			x: \$5.40 T	ri: \$	5.35	
		_	451.0 .			
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003						
Report for Race # 4 at LS (CLM 1m 15000) on May 12, 201	9					
======================================						
Coloctions	Results:					
Selections:						
4 6 1 113 1 111 4 1	Mesures.	_	<i>t-</i> 00 <i>t</i> 0		+0 00	
1 Peej - settled, bid 4w, empty	Nesures.	3			\$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way	Results.	1	\$5.00 \$0. \$0.	00	\$0.00	
	Results.	1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way	RESULCS.	1 2		00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way	Results.	1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way	Results.	1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way	RESULCS.	1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid		1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	
<pre>2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003</pre>		1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201		1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201		1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201		1 2	\$0.	00	\$0.00 \$0.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T	00 :	\$0.00 \$0.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T	00 : ri: \$(\$0.00 \$0.00 3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3.	00 : ri: \$	\$0.00 \$0.00 2.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3.	00 : ri: \$	\$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 ====== \$3.20 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. T	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3.	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. T	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9	1 2 E	\$0. T	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results:	1 2 E	\$0. T	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results:	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60	00 :: \$(\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 	2 E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T	00 : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : :	\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 Results:	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6.	00 :	\$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6.	00 : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : :	\$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$23.85	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201 Selections: 7 Hot Harvey - bmp brk,3p trn,lead1/4 5 Bogey - 6wd3/8, retreated 1 Orbatron - bid4w1/4,vied,brsh str 3 Freedom Factor - 4w trn,5w3/16,outfnshd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at LS (ALW 1 1/16 22000) on May 12, Selections: 2 Mallory's Bandit - 3-4w trns,5w into lane 5 Collateral Kitten - rail move,outdueled 1 Poderoso Equs - settled, 2w, drew away	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6.	00 : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : :	\$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85	
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6.	00 : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : : :	\$0.00 \$0.00 \$0.00 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$23.85	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201 Selections: 7 Hot Harvey - bmp brk,3p trn,lead1/4 5 Bogey - 6wd3/8, retreated 1 Orbatron - bid4w1/4,vied,brsh str 3 Freedom Factor - 4w trn,5w3/16,outfnshd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at LS (ALW 1 1/16 22000) on May 12, Selections: 2 Mallory's Bandit - 3-4w trns,5w into lane 5 Collateral Kitten - rail move,outdueled 1 Poderoso Equs - settled, 2w, drew away	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6.	00 :: ri: \$ 60 :: Tri::: Tri:::	\$0.00 \$0.00 0.00 333.20 \$33.00 \$22.80 \$33.80 \$22.40 \$22.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201 Selections: 7 Hot Harvey - bmp brk,3p trn,lead1/4 5 Bogey - 6wd3/8, retreated 1 Orbatron - bid4w1/4,vied,brsh str 3 Freedom Factor - 4w trn,5w3/16,outfnshd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at LS (ALW 1 1/16 22000) on May 12, Selections: 2 Mallory's Bandit - 3-4w trns,5w into lane 5 Collateral Kitten - rail move,outdueled 1 Poderoso Equs - settled, 2w, drew away	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4.	00 :: ri: \$ 60 :: Tri::: Tri:::	\$0.00 \$0.00 0.00 333.20 \$33.00 \$22.80 \$33.80 \$22.40 \$22.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201 Selections: 7 Hot Harvey - bmp brk,3p trn,lead1/4 5 Bogey - 6wd3/8, retreated 1 Orbatron - bid4w1/4,vied,brsh str 3 Freedom Factor - 4w trn,5w3/16,outfnshd Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at LS (ALW 1 1/16 22000) on May 12, Selections: 2 Mallory's Bandit - 3-4w trns,5w into lane 5 Collateral Kitten - rail move,outdueled 1 Poderoso Equs - settled, 2w, drew away	9 Results: 2019 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4.	00 :: ri: \$ 60 :: Tri::: Tri:::	\$0.00 \$0.00 0.00 333.20 \$33.00 \$22.80 \$33.80 \$22.40 \$22.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 Results:	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4.	00 :: ri: \$ 60 :: Tri::: Tri:::	\$0.00 \$0.00 0.00 333.20 \$33.00 \$22.80 \$33.80 \$22.40 \$22.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 Results: 2019 Results:	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4.	00 :: ri: \$ 60 :: Tri::: Tri:::	\$0.00 \$0.00 0.00 333.20 \$33.00 \$22.80 \$33.80 \$22.40 \$22.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0.	00 :: \$ fri: \$ 60 :: 70 :: 80 :: 80 :: 80 :: 71 :: !	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0.	00 :: \$ fri: \$ 60 :: 70 :: 80 :: 80 :: 80 :: 71 :: !	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0.	00 :: \$ fri: \$ 60 :: 70 :: 80 :: 80 :: 80 :: 71 :: !	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0.	00 :: \$ fri: \$ 60 :: 70 :: 80 :: 80 :: 80 :: 71 :: !	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.80	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	2 E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E	\$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0. \$0.	00 :: \$1 60 :: \$1 70 :: \$1 71 :: \$1	\$3.20 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00	00 :: \$4 Fri: \$4	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00	00 :: \$4 ri: \$4 60 :: 51 Tri::! Tri::! 40 :: 51	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.20 \$2.80 \$2.80 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$2.40 \$2.20	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00	00 :: \$4 ri: \$4 60 :: 51 Tri::! Tri::! 40 :: 51	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00 \$3.40 \$2. \$3.	00 :: \$1 ri: \$4 60 :: \$1 7	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55 \$24.55	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00	00 :: \$1 ri: \$4 60 :: \$1 7	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55 \$24.55	===
2 Topcatmark - pace inside, gave way 3 Bourbon Soul - unrushed,no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at LS (ALW 1m 24000) on May 12, 201	9 	1 2 E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E E	\$0. x: \$6.40 T \$7.60 \$3. \$3. x: \$29.60 \$16.40 \$6. \$4. x: \$60.00 \$3.40 \$2. \$3.	00 :: \$1 ri: \$4 60 :: \$1 7	\$3.20 \$3.20 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$23.85 \$23.85 \$24.55 \$24.55	===

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at LS (CLM 7%f 13500) on May 12, 2019

=======================================	 =======================================	 ======

Selections: 4 Jail House - 2p1st,ins2nd,gave way 2 Towering Oak - ins-2p,middle move,wkn 7 Uptown Bling - 4p7/16,ins5/16,3rdbest 9 Grass Duck - clippd behind5-1/2,bmp		4 9 7	20 \$2.10 \$2.10 \$6.40 Tri:	\$0.00 \$0.00				
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at LS (MDN 5%f 23000) on May 12, 2019	9							
Selections: 5 Abbies Tank - bmpd brk,3-5w turn 8 Chamisa - 4 Ebony Nights - bmpd brk,4w1st,2p2nd 3 Mimi's Song - inside turn, no menace	Results:	7 6 4	80 \$2.80 \$5.60 \$23.80 Tri:	\$3.80 \$5.40				
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 10 at LS (CLM 5f 13500) on May 12, 2019								
Selections: 4 Just Betty - pace inside, weakened 3 Gator Vindication - off step slow,ins,bid 8 I'm a Stephanie - unhurried, no factor 1 Te Fiti - rallied, 4w, willingly	Results:	1 9 6	40 \$3.40 \$9.60 \$63.40 Tri:	\$5.40 \$10.00				