Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 1 at OP (CLM 1 1/16 24500)

on March 29, 2019

Selections: Results:
6 Yankton - press2p,gv way turn 8 $10.80 $5.80 $3.20
8 Starinthemaking - 4wd btw 1/4, even late 7 $8.20 $4.80
4 Air Power - bumped early,shiftedéw 1 $4.80
7 Jersey's Heat - shut off start, no bid 5

Ex: $38.70 Tri: $107.05
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 2 at OP (CLM 1 1/16 24000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
1 Munchies - saved ground, no bid 8 $3.80 $2.80 $2.10
3 Schuyler Warrior - 4w early,brief pursuit 3 $4.00 $2.60
8 Stina - insd,bid btw,flattened 1 $2.40
4 Wood Not Mind - settled,late gain insd 5

Ex: $6.70 Tri: $8.95
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 3 at OP (CLM 6f 39000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
8 Hidenseek Sally - 3path,bid1/4,no match 4 $7.40 $3.40 $3.00
2 Served Cold - 4wlst turn,pressed foe 1 $7.00 $4.00
6 Plum Gorgeous - chased, bid, weakened, 2 $3.00
1 Sophie's Angel - bumped start,faded 8

Ex: $24.90 Tri: $44.85
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 4 at OP (MDN 6f 90000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
8 Zip Your Lip - pressed rail, resisted 3 $7.00 $3.00 $2.40
7 Cavaradossi - 4-5w upper, faltered 8 $2.40 $2.20
3 Alkhaatam - 4-5p turn,6p into lane 4 $3.40
5 Miracle Hill - forward 4wd, gave way, 7

Ex: $7.50 Tri: $21.80
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 5 at OP (CLM 6f 25000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
3 Crimson Creed - evenly 3 $19.20 $8.40 $5.80
7 Place the Blame - tracked btw,fanned 5wd 8 $7.80 $4.80
5 Molly's Game - improved position late 2 $6.00
1 Belle Meade Dancer - brsh st,4p,bid3/8,falt 1

Ex: $62.20 Tri: $227.95
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 6 at OP (ALW 6f 91000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
7 One Man Party - pressed rail,edged clr 5 $7.60 $4.40 $2.80
3 Jack Van Berg - dueled inside,no match 7 $4.00 $2.60
8 B P Rocket - eased back,bid 4wl/4 8 $2.20
5 Bano Solo - pressed btw, gave way, 6

Ex: $15.30 Tri: $16.60
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 7 at OP (CLM 6f 42000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
5 Getoffmyback - rail trip, even effort 5 $7.00 $4.60 $2.60
4 Fascilitator - bid7/16,3-2 trn,gamely 2 $15.80 $8.60
8 Mines Made Up - drew off,kept to task 1 $7.80
6 Allaboutmike - awk st,led inside 6

Ex: $54.40 Tri: $205.95

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003



Report for Race # 8 at OP (ALW 1m 91000) on March 29, 2019

Selections: Results:
10 Sonny Smack - angled 4wd, even late 6 $72.20 $23.20 $16.40
3 Run Tappy - bid1/4,splt rvls3/16 9 $13.20 $8.60
7 Always - awkwrd brk,imprvd insd 5 $20.40
1 Attain Success - press,bidl/4,outfinshd 3

Ex: $321.80 Tri: $4,315.55
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at OP (MDN 1 1/16 90000) on March 29, 2019
Selections: Results:
6 Calle Patron - inside trip, edged 2nd 5 $9.00 $4.20 $2.80
8 Young Bull - 2path,no bid 6 $3.40 $2.60
7 Crow Mountain - 4wd early, faded 8 $2.60
5 East Moon Lake - trackd btw,rail,no bid 7

Ex: $14.70 Tri: $18.05



