Selections:	Results:				
B Tricky Lion - stdy early, dull	weadlts:	1	\$29.80	\$10.60	\$4.40
Grandiflora - pace ins,duel,willng		5	Ψ 2 3.00	\$6.40	
Uncle Youdge - rail, weakened 1/8		7		\$0. 10	\$2.10
Fly E Dubai - swung wide, no factor		3			
			Ex: \$66.	90 Tri:	\$167.60
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 2 at PIM (MDN 4½f 33000) on May 9, 20					
elections:	Results:				
Musta Never Met U - through early	Results.		\$5.00	\$2.60	\$2.10
On the Turf -		5		\$2.40	
So Street -		1			\$2.40
Get There John -		3	Ex: \$6.0	0 Tri:	\$10.90
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 3 at PIM (ALW 5f 27000) on May 9, 20: 				.======	======
elections:	Results:		d	d2 00	do
Madame Tiger - vied wide, outfinished Eye On Berlin - outrun		7 3	\$4.40	\$3.00 \$4.40	
No More Excuses - 3wd ins foe uppr,wllng		8		p4.40	\$3.40 \$5.60
Miss Tschetter - agressive hand ride		6			45.00
-			Ex: \$10.	40 Tri:	\$80.10
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003					
eport for Race # 4 at PIM (CLM 1 1/16 17000) on May 9					
elections:	Results:				
Battle Ready - duel ins,drft out,held		3	\$7.80	\$4.20	\$3.20
Cause He's Western - btw,drop bck 3/8,empty		2		\$25.80	
Promote - 3w2ndturn,bump3/16		1			\$5.40
Bobby the Brain - rail turn, dueled 2nd		7	Ex: \$69.	00 Tri:	\$337.76
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 5 at PIM (CLM 1m 21000) on May 9, 20: 				.======	
elections	Recul+c.				
elections: Cort'n Asong - stumbled badly,faded	Results:	2	\$5.20	\$3.20	\$2.40
Minister's Strike - gave way		9		\$6.00	
No More Talk - duel, ins foes upr, gme		8			\$4.80
		5			
Berliner - dueled ins, weakened			Ex: \$20.	70 Tri:	\$113.50
Berliner - dueled ins, weakened					
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	. 2019				
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9					=====
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9					
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in	-	1		\$11.60	\$6.40
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried,no bid	-	1 8			\$6.40 \$6.60
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4, by-faders	-	1 8 7		\$11.60	\$6.40
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4, by-faders	-	1 8	\$24.60	\$11.60	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20
elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried,no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals	-	1 8 7	\$24.60	\$11.60 \$13.40	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried,no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20:	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40 5.20 Tri	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.3
Berliner - dueled ins, weakened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20:	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40 5.20 Tri	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.3
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried,no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20:	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.3
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20: elections: Brooks Robinson - dueled outside foe,drg	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40 5.20 Tri	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.3
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9 elections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4, by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20: elections: Brooks Robinson - dueled outside foe,drg 0 More Abundance - chased, gave way	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.5
Plections: Auzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Peport for Race # 6 at PIM (MDN 1 1/16 18000) on May 9. Pelections: Kustaafu - 4wd 3/8, angled in Awesome Agenda - unhurried, no bid Charismatic Blue - 3wd 1/4,by-faders Mike the Tiger - passed tiring rivals Auzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Peport for Race # 7 at PIM (ALW 5f 35000) on May 9, 20: Pelections: Brooks Robinson - dueled outside foe,drg	Results:	1 8 7 6	\$24.60 Ex: \$185	\$11.60 \$13.40 5.20 Tri	\$6.40 \$6.60 \$2.20 : \$591.3

Report for Race # 8 at PIM (ALW 1 1/16 45000) on May 9, 2019

Results:

3 \$38.20 \$16.80 \$5.80
1 \$13.80 \$5.60
5 \$2.60
4 Fx: \$104.60 Tri: \$592. Selections: 4 Aveenu Malcainu - stumbled st, tired 6 Sanavi - 3path, couldn't last 5 Throw the Fade - drifted out late,drvng 3 Warrioroftheroses - 7-4wd, retreated

Ex: \$104.60 Tri: \$592.70

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at PIM (CLM 1m 21000) on May 9, 2019

Se	lections:	Results:			
3	Senor Louie - 3-4w,btw 3/8,wknd	1	\$4.40	\$2.80	\$2.20
1	Speed Game - blocked turn, gaining	6		\$7.00	\$3.20
2	Zen's Land - squeezed start	4			\$3.00
9	Brickyard Kitten - off duel, angled, empty	2			
			Ex: \$1	5.40 Tri:	\$55.70