Report for Race # 1 at PRM (MDN 5f 12000) on			
Selections:	Results:		
5 Shesa Tough Gal - retreated	Results:	1	\$33.60 \$10.40 \$4.40
6 Dreamingndiamonds - worn down late		6	\$8.40 \$3.80
4 Special Trip - clear turn, reeled in 1 Rocket First - ducked out 1/8th pole		4	\$2.10
1 ROCKEC FIRST - ducked out 1/8th pole		5	Ex: \$202.80 Tri: \$46.55
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 2 at PRM (CLM 6f 12500) on	June 8, 2019		
Selections:	Results:		
5 Talkin Shannon - angled 4wd, driving			\$3.40 \$2.40 \$2.10
4 Dorothe Marie - 5wd, bid turn, empty 1 Dixie Lover - clear turn, held well		2 6	\$7.00 \$4.40 \$5.60
2 Miss Placed Plan - mild late interest		3	\$5.00
			Ex: \$17.00 Tri: \$47.35
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 3 at PRM (MDN 1m 41933) on			
	=======================================		
Selections:	Results:		\$7.20 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$4.60 \$2.60
3 That's What I Say - 3 wide trip, kept on 2 Painted Canyon - bid turn, empty		3	\$7.20 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$4.60 \$2.60
4 Charlie's Lucky - showed little		5	\$2.80
5 Larch - steadied st, late bid		4	
			Ex: \$23.40 Tri: \$15.15
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 4 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on			
Colostions	B 31		
Selections: 5 Lookie Loo - forced pace.led.missed	Results:	5	\$3.60 \$2.40 \$2.10 \$3.80 \$2.40 \$4.20
6 Call a Cop - always in command		4	\$3.80 \$2.40
5 Lookie Loo - forced pace,led,missed 6 Call a Cop - always in command 4 Lovin' the Rush - never menaced 2 Galaxy's Wildcat - chased, stayed on			\$4.20
2 Galaxy's Wildcat - chased, stayed on		3	Ex: \$8.80 Tri: \$15.50
			EX. \$6.60 III. \$15.50
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at PRM (MDN 5%f 11000) on	Tuno 9 2010		
Soloctions:	Posults		
Selections: 7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th	Results:	3	\$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th	Results:	3	\$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.10
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on	Results:	3 7 5	\$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th	Results:	3	\$2.40 \$2.10
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on	Results:	3 7 5	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced	Results:	3 7 5	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on		3 7 5	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections:	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid	June 8, 2019 	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5%f 24242) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5%f 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$3.00
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5%f 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5%f 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALM 5½f 33000) on Selections:	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5Xf 33000) on Selections: 1 E Rated - bothered st, nailed 6 Attain Success - bid turn, empty	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on Selections: 2 Geertz's Gal - gave way on turn 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5Xf 33000) on Selections: 1 E Rated - bothered st, nailed 6 Attain Success - bid turn, empty	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.60 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on 3 Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5Xf 33000) on 3 Selections: 1 E Rated - bothered st, nailed 6 Attain Success - bid turn, empty 5 Curlinate - dueled off rail,drivng 4 Rebel Rouser - forward,urged, kept on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwandly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 75 4 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5Xf 24242) on 3 Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5Xf 33000) on 3 Selections: 1 E Rated - bothered st, nailed 6 Attain Success - bid turn, empty 5 Curlinate - dueled off rail,drivng 4 Rebel Rouser - forward,urged, kept on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95 \$9.80 \$3.80 \$2.60 \$7.40 Ex: \$20.40 Tri: \$38.30
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on 3 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 CameIntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 3 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 3 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 4 Rebel Rouser - forward, urged, kept on Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at PRM (MDN 5½f 14414) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 1 7 4 6	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95 \$9.80 \$3.80 \$2.60 \$7.40 Ex: \$20.40 Tri: \$38.30
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on 5 Selections: 10 Sydney Elizabeth - 5 wide bid, hung 8 Runa - swung 5 wide, mild bid 7 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 Camelntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALM 5½f 33000) on 5 Selections: 1 E Rated - bothered st, nailed 6 Attain Success - bid turn, empty 5 Curlinate - dueled off rail, drivng 4 Rebel Rouser - forward, urged, kept on Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at PRM (MDN 5½f 14414) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results:	3 7 5 4 4 1 7 4 6 6 1 0 8 2 7 7 4 6 6 2 1 1	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95 \$9.80 \$3.80 \$2.60 \$7.40 Ex: \$20.40 Tri: \$38.30
7 Haynesville - gave way last 1/8th 3 Sazerac - broke awkwardly 4 Webbs Creek Ferry - stayed on 5 Scoot Dude - never menaced Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at PRM (CLM 6f 12000) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on 3 Temple City Darlin - pulled away 1 Spunky Town - bothered st, Swd bid 7 She's a Lucky One - angled 4 wide, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at PRM (MDN 5½f 24242) on 3 Town Tattler - pace, reeled in late 1 CameIntime - Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 3 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 3 Report for Race # 8 at PRM (ALW 5½f 33000) on 4 Rebel Rouser - forward, urged, kept on Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at PRM (MDN 5½f 14414) on	June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019 Results: June 8, 2019	3 7 5 4 1 7 4 6 8 2 7	\$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60 Ex: \$8.20 Tri: \$5.60 \$6.20 \$3.40 \$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20 \$4.20 Ex: \$14.60 Tri: \$24.70 \$9.40 \$5.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 \$5.00 \$3.40 Ex: \$51.80 Tri: \$83.95 \$9.80 \$3.80 \$2.60 \$7.40 Ex: \$20.40 Tri: \$38.30

11 Launch Light Lucy - weakened 2 Stephanie's City - chased pace, empty 1 Sugar Cream - brushed st, inside bid 11 \$3.80 \$3.60 2 \$4.00 9

Ex: \$37.00 Tri: \$43.45