elections: Drink Mo Hennessy - opened up, held Rhythm'n Song - 5-w 2nd, no rally Stylistic - floated 5w, flattened Mama's Kid - toss head st, 4w move	Results:	8 1 4 6	\$4.80	\$2.40 \$3.40	\$2.40 \$3.00
			EX: \$5.5	90 Tri:	\$17.50
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 5 at RUI (ALW 5f 4000) on June 7	,		.=====		
Selections: 8 Seven Silver Coins - bmpd brk,press,cleared 10 Deck Humor - 5-w, mild rally 2 Party King - no match, 2nd best 3 Cindys Chime -	Results:	10 8 2 7	\$10.20	\$3.60 \$2.20	
Cinays Chine		Ex: \$8.70 Tri: \$16.20			
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003					
. , ,	7, 2019 				======
elections:	7, 2019 Results:	 5	\$3.40	====== \$2.20	====== \$2.10
elections: Shame On Powers - drew off, easy winner Iced - floated 8w, no bid Abbie's Way - no match, 2nd best	· :=======:	5 1 6 7	\$3.40	\$2.20 \$3.00	
elections: Shame On Powers - drew off, easy winner Iced - floated 8w, no bid Abbie's Way - no match, 2nd best	· :=======:	1 6			\$2.40 \$2.60
delections: Shame On Powers - drew off, easy winner Siced - floated 8w, no bid Abbie's Way - no match, 2nd best Lookinforthewolf - Suzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	Results:	1 6		\$3.00	\$2.40 \$2.60
elections: Shame On Powers - drew off, easy winner Iced - floated 8w, no bid Abbie's Way - no match, 2nd best Lookinforthewolf - uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	Results:	1 6		\$3.00	\$2.40 \$2.60
Report for Race # 7 at RUI (ALW 5f 4000) on June 7 Selections: Selections: Shame On Powers - drew off, easy winner Lod - floated 8w, no bid Abbie's Way - no match, 2nd best Lookinforthewolf - Suzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at RUI (ALW 5f 4000) on June 7 Selections: Stormin Fast - bmpd brk, 6w 3/16 Road to Heat - L Wiskey Crown - no match, 2nd best	Results:	1 6	Ex: \$5.2	\$3.00 20 Tri:	\$2.40 \$2.60 \$11.00

Ex: \$53.30 Tri: \$147.60