Fuzzy's Horse Pick's

Copyright 2003

Report for Race # 1 at SA (CLM 1m 33000)

SA@11019Results

on January 10, 2019

Selections: Results:
3 Speakers - saved ground, no rally 2 $11.80 $6.60 $3.40
1 Mraseel (IRE) - 3wd 2nd turn,no bid 4 $12.40 $5.40
6 Goseecal - pulled,inside,wkened 3 $3.40
7 Wind Tartare (FR) - 3wd,4wd,weakened 1

Ex: $54.90 Tri: $114.15
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 2 at SA (MDN 6f 55000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
2 Victory Element - 2wd,rail str,held 2nd 6 $6.40 $2.60 $2.20
4 Mantaray Island - vied tn,could not hold 2 $2.20 $2.10
6 Candy Cornell - 4wd turn,up late 3rd 3 $5.60
5 Somethintotapabout - 5

Ex: $5.10 Tri: $18.10
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 3 at SA (MDN 1m 55000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
1 Slewgoodtobetrue - 4wd,3wd,2nd best 1 $3.00 $2.40 $2.10
7 Claudelle - 3wd into str,no bid 6 $3.20 $2.60
6 Soothing - 3wd bid,led,best rest 7 $2.60
3 Show Hostess - 4wd,3wd,2nd best 5

Ex: $4.90 Tri: $4.15
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 4 at SA (CLM 1m 33000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
6 Peach Cove (NZ) - came out str,edged 2nd 6 $22.20 $6.40 $3.60
3 Miss Boom Boom - 7wd into lane,no bid 1 $2.20
1 Girl Downstairs - 3wd into str,led,edged 4 $5.60
7 Emmy and I - inside,dueled,held 3rd 5

Ex: $25.60 Tri: $106.75
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 6%f 32000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
8 Ohtani - pinched,stdied start 7 $12.00 $5.20 $3.60
3 Drink - came out str,no rally 3 $2.80
5 Gran Martillo - 3-4wd, angled in late 2 $2.60
2 Nice Work - stalked pace, no rally 8

Ex: $23.80 Tri: $37.95
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 6 at SA (CLM 6%f 36000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
4 Favorite Trip - fanned 6wd into lane 2 $5.20 $3.40 $2.80
1 Ladybug - 3wd,4wd,no rally 5 $8.20  $5.20
2 Sheza Chattykat - 3wd to turn,best rest 3 $15.40
7 Florista (IRE) - off bit slow,no rally 9

Ex: $20.20 Tri: $120.40
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 7 at SA (CLM 6f 38000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
4 Allaboutaction - stalked btwn,weakened 4 $4.40 $3.00 $2.40
3 Kochees - 3wd into str,2nd best 1 $3.80 $3.60
5 Italiano - re-bid 3wd,led,held 2d 2 $4.80
2 Adens Dream - bit tight 3-1/2,3w str 6

Ex: $10.60 Tri: $23.40
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Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 8 at SA (ALW 6%f 67000) on January 10, 2019

Selections: Results:
4 S Y Sky - led,bump late,edged 5 $6.00 $2.40 $2.20
5 Show It N Moe It - off bit slow,4wd lane 4 $2.20 $2.10
6 Barbara Beatrice - 3wd 1st turn,no bid 2 $4.60
1 Isa Firecracker - hit rival with whip 6

Ex: $4.60 Tri: $15.60
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at SA (MDN 6%f 55000) on January 10, 2019
Selections: Results:
6 Radish - steadied 1/2,no rally 4 $11.40 $6.00 $4.20
3 Smoovie - 3wd,4wd,willingly 6 $6.40 $4.80
5 Oh Pretty Woman - bumped,steadied 3/8 10 $4.80
4 Smiling Annie - 3wd str,steadied 1/8 3

Ex: $39.40 Tri: $116.35
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