| Selections:  | Results:                                |                                      |  |
|--|---|--------------------------------------|--|
| 1 Red Envelope - vied 5wd,led,clear  |   |                                      | \$7.80 \$4.00 \$2.20   |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| 3 Raul Rosas - 4wd, 3wd, weakened  |   | 4                                    |  |
| 5 Cyclometric - 4wd into str,no rally  |   | 1                                    | \$2.40   |
| 4 Nap Lajoie - bit washy,bid btwn  |   | 2                                    | F #12 00 T-: #15 15  |
|  |   |                                      | Ex: \$12.00 Tri: \$15.15   |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  |   |                                      |  |
| Report for Race # 2 at SA (CLM 6f 35000) on February 2   |   |                                      |  |
|  |   | ====                                 |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Selections:  | Results:                                |                                      |  |
| 2 Denman's Call - bid btwn turn, gamely  |   | 2                                    | \$6.40 \$3.00 \$2.40   |
| 4 Allaboutmike - fought back rail,game   |   | 1                                    |  |
| 6 Stone Hands - 3wd ito str,weakened   |   | 4                                    | \$2.60   |
| 1 Kochees - off bit slow,outkicked   |   | 6                                    |  |
| •  |   |                                      | Ex: \$12.10 Tri: \$13.75   |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  |   |                                      |  |
| Report for Race # 3 at SA (CLM 1m 24000) on February 2   | . 2019                                  |                                      |  |
| ======================================   |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Selections:  | Pecul+c.                                |                                      |  |
| Selections:  | Results:                                | 2                                    | #17 CO #C 40 #4 00   |
| 3 Pioneerof the West - bid 3wd,4wd,led,clear   |   |                                      | \$17.60 \$6.40 \$4.00  |
| 2 Holland Road - stalked pace,gained 2d  |   | 3                                    |  |
| 5 Bedeviled - angled in str,no rally   |   | 7                                    | \$6.80   |
| 1 Crown the Kitten - 3wd into str,best rest  |   | 5                                    |  |
|  |   |                                      | Ex: \$22.00 Tri: \$104.15  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  |   |                                      |  |
| Report for Race # 4 at SA (ALW 6f 57000) on February 2   | , 2019                                  |                                      |  |
|  |   | ====                                 |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
|  |   |                                      |  |
| Selections:  | Results:                                |                                      |  |
| 5 Tyfosha - stalked pace, held 3rd   |   |                                      | \$9.20 \$4.60 \$3.20   |
| 7 Tiz Toffee - dueled, caught late   |   | 1                                    | \$5.20 \$4.00 \$3.20<br>\$5.00 \$2.20  |
|  |   | 5                                    | \$5.00 \$3.20  |
| 6 Leveler - edged 3rd btwn late  |   | >                                    | \$2.20   |
| 1 No Wine Untasted - off rail,edged for 3rd  |   | 2                                    |  |
| ,  |   | 3                                    |  |
| , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,  |   | 3                                    | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55   |
| , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,  |   | 3                                    |  |
|  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003<br>Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003<br>Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003<br>Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  |   | 3                                    |  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   |   | -===                                 | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br>                              | -===                                 | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br>                              | -===                                 | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br>                              | -===                                 | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55  \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely  | , 2019<br>                              | 5<br>8                               | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55  \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2 Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in  | , 2019<br>                              | 5<br>8<br>3                          | Ex: \$24.90 Tri: \$25.55  \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2 Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in  | , 2019<br>                              | 5<br>8<br>3                          | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2 Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in  | , 2019<br>                              | 5<br>8<br>3                          | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -   | , 2019<br>                              | 5<br>8<br>3                          | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003  | , 2019<br><br>Results:                  | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -   | , 2019<br><br>Results:                  | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$7.60 \$2:\$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br><br>Results:                  | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$7.60 \$2:\$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br><br>Results:                  | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$7.60 \$2:\$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2   | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$7.60 \$2:\$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February Selections:  | , 2019<br><br>Results:                  | 5 8 3 4                              | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gummetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied  | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$2.20 \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20 \$3.20 \$2.10  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared  | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5 8 3 4                              | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$2.20   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best   | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$2.20 \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20 \$3.20 \$2.10  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared  | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5 8 3 4                              | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.10 \$2.60 \$2.60  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best   | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$7.60 \$2.20   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best   | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.10 \$2.60 \$2.60  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  | , 2019<br>Results:                      | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.10 \$2.60 \$2.60  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003   | , 2019  Results:  ary 2, 2019  Results: | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.10 \$2.60 \$2.60  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3  | , 2019  Results:  ary 2, 2019  Results: | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003   | , 2019  Results:  ary 2, 2019  Results: | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3  | , 2019  Results:  ary 2, 2019  Results: | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3  Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3   | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3  | , 2019  Results:  ary 2, 2019  Results: | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3  Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February 3   | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4                     | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.3 \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$ |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections: 5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February:  Selections: 3 Calder Vale - came out str,no bid   | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4<br>5<br>4<br>3<br>2 | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.40 \$2.40 \$2.60  Ex: \$3.70  |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February:  Selections: 3 Calder Vale - came out str,no bid 9 R B Eye - Swd into str,no bid  | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4<br>5<br>4<br>3<br>2 | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.30 \$2.40   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February:  Selections: 3 Calder Vale - came out str,no bid 9 R B Eye - 5wd into str,no rally 8 Royal Aspirations - stalked 4wd,drifted in | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4<br>5<br>4<br>3<br>2 | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.60  Ex: \$3.80 \$711 \$2.60  Ex: \$2.40 \$2.10 \$2.60   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February:  Selections: 3 Calder Vale - came out str,no bid 9 R B Eye - Swd into str,no bid  | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4<br>5<br>4<br>3<br>2 | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$3.20 \$2.60 \$7.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20  \$3.20 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$2.60  Ex: \$3.80 Tri: \$58.20   |
| Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at SA (MDN 7f 55000) on February 2  Selections:  5 Omaha Beach - stumbled start,gamely 8 One Bad Boy - steadied 3-1/2,up 3rd 7 Moonoverthebayou - 4wd into str,drift in 1 Polar -  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (STK 1 1/16 150000) on February  Selections: 4 Gunmetal Gray - 4wd into str,rallied 2 Magnificent McCool - 3wd into str,cleared 5 Mucho Gusto - inside duel,2nd best 3 Easy Shot - chased,steadied 1/16  Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at SA (MDN 5%f 23000) on February:  Selections: 3 Calder Vale - came out str,no bid 9 R B Eye - 5wd into str,no rally 8 Royal Aspirations - stalked 4wd,drifted in | , 2019  Results:  Results:              | 5<br>8<br>3<br>4<br>5<br>4<br>3<br>2 | \$3.40 \$2.20 \$2.10 \$7.60 \$2.30 \$2.40   |

| Report for Race # 8 at  | SA (MDN   | 6%f 55000)  | on  | February 2 | 2019   |
|-------------------------|-----------|-------------|-----|------------|--------|
| report for race is o at | 3A (11014 | 0/21 33000) | 011 | icoidaiy 2 | , 2010 |

|              |              | ,          | , , .                                   |   |
|--------------|--------------|------------|---|---|
| ============ | ============ | ========== | ======================================= | ======================================= |

| Selections:                           | Results:                |
|---------------------------------------|-------------------------|
| 5 My Mandate - inside, edged 2wd late | 5 \$5.00 \$2.80 \$2.40  |
| 6 Whitehouse Road -                   | 4 \$4.40 \$3.20         |
| 8 Norski - split foes 1/4,2d best     | 9 \$5.80                |
| 1 Time Is Now -                       | 1                       |
|                                       | Ex: \$8.10 Tri: \$31.95 |

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at SA (STK 1 1/8 200000) on February 2, 2019

| Se | lections:                                 | Results: |           |        |        |
|----|---|----------|-----------|--------|--------|
| 7  | McKinzie - 4wd turn, ridden out           | 8        | \$6.80    | \$2.60 | \$2.10 |
| 8  | Battle of Midway - bid btwn, rail, gamely | 7        |           | \$2.10 | \$2.10 |
| 5  | Giant Expectations - off slow, belatedly  | 5        |           |        | \$2.60 |
| 1  | Pavel - never a factor                    | 1        |           |        |        |
|    |   | E        | x: \$5.50 | Tri:   | \$6.55 |

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 10 at SA (CLM 5%f 18000) on February 2, 2019

| Selections:                                  | Results: |    |           |        |        |
|--|----------|----|-----------|--------|--------|
| 1 Candyman Garret - 3wd into str,wkened      |          | 5  | \$7.00    | \$3.00 | \$2.40 |
| 10 Cayate - inside,edged for 3rd             |          | 10 |           | \$2.60 | \$2.20 |
| 2 Advantageous - vied btwn, cleared          |          | 9  |           |        | \$2.80 |
| 5 Isee It in Hiseyes - 3wd into str,2nd best |          | 11 |           |        |        |
|  |          |    | Ev. \$7 0 | a Tri. | ¢11 60 |