Soloctions:	Pag. 14		
Selections: 4 Mobou - 3wd into str,led,game	Results:	7	\$8.40 \$4.80 \$3.40
B Jet Set Ruler - stalked rail,edged 2nd		6	\$5.00 \$3.80
9 Feeling Strong - 4wd into str,drift in		1	\$8.40
7 The Street Fighter - pulled, stalked, wkened		2	Ex: \$26.40 Tri: \$169.86
			EX. \$20.40 H1. \$105.00
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 2 at SA (CLM 6f 33000) on Apri			
Selections:	Results:		
6 Conquest Cobra - 3wd into str.up late		5	\$12.00 \$8.20 \$5.00
3 Annie's Candy - bit off rail,no rally 1 Don't Stalk Me - fanned 4w, no rally		2	\$6.00 \$3.60 \$3.40
2 Best Two Minutes - angled in turn,no bid		2 1 6	\$5.40
			Ex: \$31.70 Tri: \$62.30
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 3 at SA (ALW 1m 57000) on Apri	1 7, 2019		
Selections: 1 Withholding Info - 4wd into str,bid,edged	Results:		\$3.20 \$2.60 \$2.10
5 Convince - inside duel,willingly		1	\$6.80 \$3.60
3 Sutro - saved ground to lane		6	\$2.60
L Kaydetre - bit off rail,held game		3	Ex: \$10.50 Tri: \$14.50
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
eport for Race # 4 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 57000) on A			
Selections:	Results:		dr 00 do 00 do 00
Sapphire Kid - 3wd,4wd,led,clear Guiliana (FR) - disputed 2nd, weakened		7	\$5.80 \$3.00 \$2.80 \$3.40 \$2.60
Gratzie (GB) - no speed		4	\$2.40
Animosity - stalked 3wd,no rally		3	Ex: \$7.40 Tri: \$9.95
			EX: \$7.40 IF1: \$9.95
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003			
Report for Race # 5 at SA (ALW 6f 57000) on Apri			
Selections:	Results:		
7 There and Back - inside duel,cleared		5	\$4.80 \$2.80 \$2.20
2 Coil Me Home - stalked btwn,up 3rd		2 7	
5 Soul Streit - dueled,2nd best 8 Adens Dream - inside duel,held game		8	
			Ex: \$7.70 Tri: \$10.55
Firmula Hanna Bialda Cannaiaht 2002			
-uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at SA (MDN 6%f 23000) on Apr			
	========		
Selections:	Results:		
Samurai Jack - saved ground, best rest		11	do 00 do 40 do 00
			\$3.00 \$2.40 \$2.20
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly		12	\$5.40 \$4.00
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly		7	
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly			\$5.40 \$4.00
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened		7	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A		7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A		7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str,rallied	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str,rallied Seio (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid	Results:	7 5 6 4	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str,rallied Seio (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str,rallied Seio (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid	Results:	7 5 6 4 2	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str, rallied Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid	Results:	7 5 6 4 2	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str,rallied Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid Conquest Lemonraid - off slw,bmp str,chased Maestro Dearte - came out str,mild bid uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apr	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly i John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 3. Suzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Suzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 report for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apr	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.09
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly i John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 3 John's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 John April 1985 (1986) Support for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on April 1985 (1986) Amount of the common str, rallied 1986 (1986) Support for Str, rallied 1986 (1986) Amount of the common str, rallied 1986 (1986) Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid 1986 (1986) Support for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on April 1986 (1986)	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.09
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly in John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 3. Export for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 1. Export for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 1. Export (GB) - came out str,rallied Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid 1. Conquest Lemonraid - off slw,bmp str,chased 1. Maestro Dearte - came out str,mild bid 1. Export Str. Sale Seport for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apresented the sale Sale Sale Sale Sale Sale Sale Sale S	Results:	7 5	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.09
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly i John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 3. Suzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 3. Support for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Support for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Support for Race # 0 and out str, rallied 3. Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid 4. Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased 5. Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid 5. Support for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on April 2003 4. Support for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on April 2003 5. Support for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on April 2003	Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0!
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A elections: Souter (GB) - came out str, rallied Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apr elections: Dream Tree - off bit slow, gave way Emboldened - rail bid, vied, edged 2d Spectator - leapt up, hit gate, 2w	Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.00
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly i John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report (BB) - came out str, rallied 3. Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid 3. Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased 4. Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid 4. Report for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apresent for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Ap	Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0!
1. Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly i John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 2. Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3. Report (BB) - came out str, rallied 3. Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid 3. Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased 4. Maestro Dearte - came out str, mild bid 4. Report for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apresent for Race # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Ap	Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0!
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2 Fortnite Dance # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 2 Fortnite Dance # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,no bid 3 Fortnite Conquest Lemonraid - off slw,bmp str,chased 4 Maestro Dearte - came out str,mild bid 4 Maestro Dearte - came out str,mild bid 5 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,mild bid 6 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,mild bid 7 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str,mild bid 8 Fortnit	Results: il 7, 2019 Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0!
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2 Fortnite Dance - 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on Aprile Dance - Compared Dance - All Dance - Compared Dance -	Results: il 7, 2019 Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0! \$43.20 \$15.60 \$8.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$112.70 Tri: \$207.0
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 2 Fortnite Dance - 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on Aprile Dance - Compared Dance - All Dance - Compared Dance -	Results: il 7, 2019 Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0 \$43.20 \$15.60 \$8.60 \$3.40 \$3.40 Ex: \$112.70 Tri: \$207.
1 Jack's a Diva - inside duel, willingly John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 2 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str, wkened 2 Fortnite Dance # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 2 Fortnite Dance # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on A 3 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, no bid 3 Fortnite Conquest Lemonraid - off slw, bmp str, chased 3 Fortnite Dearte - came out str, mild bid 3 Fortnite Dance # 8 at SA (STK 6f 100000) on Apri 4 Fortnite Sejo (IRE) - 4wd into str, mild bid 4 Fortnite Dearte - came out str, mild bid 4 Fortnite Dearte - came out str, mild bid 5 Fortnite Dearte - came out str, mild bid 5 Fortnite Dearte - came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 6 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 7 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 7 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 7 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 7 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 7 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance # Str, came out str, mild bid 8 Fortnite Dance #	Results: il 7, 2019 Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9 3	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.0 \$43.20 \$15.60 \$8.60 \$3.40 Ex: \$112.70 Tri: \$207.
11 Jack's a Diva - inside duel,willingly 5 John's Intuition - stalked pace, weakened 12 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 13 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 14 Fortnite Dance - 4wd into str,wkened 15 Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 16 Report for Race # 7 at SA (ALW 1 1/8 59000) on Apprint of the str, and	Results: il 7, 2019 Results:	7 5 6 4 2 9	\$5.40 \$4.00 \$13.60 Ex: \$7.30 Tri: \$125.25 \$8.20 \$4.60 \$3.20 \$9.00 \$6.80 \$4.00 Ex: \$41.50 Tri: \$132.05 \$43.20 \$15.60 \$8.60 \$3.80 \$3.40 Ex: \$112.70 Tri: \$207.6

10 Aussie Fox - dwelt start,stdied 1/8 9 Indoctrination (IRE) - inside duel,caught 6 Single Me Out - 3wd into str,up 2nd

9 \$2.80 \$2.40 4 \$7.40 10 Ex: \$14.30 Tri: \$95.85