	_		
elections: Zipman - 2-3w1/2,bid 4w into Shiloh Lane - carried out start, 4w	Results:	3	\$3.60 \$2.80 \$2.20 \$6.00 \$2.80
8 Catauga County - 4wd top str, wknd 9 Blue Danube - stdy,bid 4-deep,outfin		9 5	\$4.20 Ex: \$16.60 Tri: \$78.40
			EX. \$10.00 H1. \$70.40
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 2 at SUF (CLM 6f 20000) on June 9, 3			
elections:	Results:		
2 True Purpose - fired 8w, swept clear 5 Wink and a Nod - measured, drew off, 4 Cross Multiply - chased 2wd, faded		4 7 8	\$6.80 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.60 \$2.20 \$5.20
Soul Machen - 2wd trn, willingly		1	Ex: \$15.60 Tri: \$70.00
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 3 at SUF (CLM 1m 35000) on June 9,			
selections: 5 Irish Lassie - off ins str,mild drive 4 Let's Go Baby - 3w-4w 1st, faded str 8 Shanghai Dreams - duel into str, faded 2 Pointedlee - no speed, anlgd out1/8	Results:	3 4	\$21.00 \$6.00 \$4.60 \$2.60 \$2.10
		2 7	\$3.00 Ex: \$53.20 Tri: \$167.80
			2,1 \$3312011 \$10,100
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 4 at SUF (CLM 1m 25000) on June 9, .	2 01 9 =======		
elections: Somedreamscometrue - 3w-2w trip, late 3rd	Results:	9	\$6.60 \$3.80 \$2.80
Purim's Gold - rail turns, game 2nd Great Plan - off rail, full of run		2 5	
Smart Thinking - 3acrs1/4,wknd		3	Ex: \$60.40 Tri: \$243.40
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 5 at SUF (CLM 5f 35000) on June 9,			
elections:	Results:		
Shanghai Glory - pace, faltered Jersey Life - inside, no factor The Two Nancy's - rallied		1 2 7	\$8.80 \$4.20 \$2.80 \$3.60 \$2.60 \$3.40
Takin It Easy - stdy 5/16,angl,even		5	Ex: \$30.40 Tri: \$107.40
uzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 eport for Race # 6 at SUF (CLM 1 1/16 27500) on June			
	=======		
		10	\$31.00 \$13.80 \$10.00
Thrice - rated to str, drvng	Results:	10	
Thrice - rated to str, drvng Superling - veer in brk, 2w, game Diablo's Darling - 2-3path turn, no bid	Results:	2 3 1	\$9.80 \$6.20 \$6.80
elections: Thrice - rated to str, drvng Superling - veer in brk, 2w, game Diablo's Darling - 2-3path turn, no bid Hallucination - covered ins 2nd, game	Results:	2	
Thrice - rated to str, drvng Superling - veer in brk, 2w, game Diablo's Darling - 2-3path turn, no bid	2019	2 3 1	\$6.80 Ex: \$300.20 Tri: \$3,005.
Thrice - rated to str, drvng Superling - veer in brk, 2w, game Diablo's Darling - 2-3path turn, no bid Hallucination - covered ins 2nd, game Juzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Peport for Race # 7 at SUF (CLM 6f 27500) on June 9,	2019	2 3 1	\$6.80 Ex: \$300.20 Tri: \$3,005
Thrice - rated to str, drvng Superling - veer in brk, 2w, game Diablo's Darling - 2-3path turn, no bid Hallucination - covered ins 2nd, game Juzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Eport for Race # 7 at SUF (CLM 6f 27500) on June 9,	2019	2 3 1	\$6.80 Ex: \$300.20 Tri: \$3,005

Report for Race # 8 at SUF (ALW 5f 55000) on June 9, 2019

Selections: 7 Contrarity - inside, steady urging 2 Ryoan - inside, weakened lane 5 Precocious Peach - carried in st,3-2w,evn 1 Aggregator - stalked, weakened	Results: 7 6 5 2	5 \$10.0	\$4.20 \$2.40		
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 9 at SUF (MDN 1 1/16 30000) on June 9,	2019 				
Selections: 8 Wee Bonnie Lass - 2wd 1st, held 2nd 1 Ariska - bid willingly 7-8 wide 5 A Little Info - svd grnd, empty 7 Wisconsin - stp slw,rail,game	Results:	9 \$6.60 5	\$5.20 \$5.80		
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 10 at SUF (STK 6f 50000) on June 9, 2019					
Selections: 1 Successful Saint - rail run, handily 3 Sydney's Magic - 2 Shamrock's Rule - 2wd turn, no match 4 Indian's Getupngo -			\$0.00 \$0.00		
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 11 at SUF (STK 6f 50000) on June 9, 201	19 				
Selections: 3 Dr Blarney - rail, handily 1 Grady - speed 2wd, tired 4 Goodbyeguinnessbok - 3-abreast, 3p turn 5 The Doc Is In - 2-4path turn, faded		•	\$0.00 \$0.00		