		====		===
Selections:	Results:			
3 Fearless Kitty - set pressured pace		4	\$17.60 \$6.00 \$3.60	
7 Jennysregalman - 4path turn, belatedly		3	\$2.40 \$2.10	
6 Rontos Society - dropped back inside,		7	\$2.20	
2 Incredible Cut - done early		5		
			Ex: \$51.40 Tri: \$28.3	5
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003				
Report for Race # 2 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	2019			
				===
Selections:	Results:			
5 Congruity - prompted outside, tired		1	\$13.80 \$5.20 \$3.60	
8 Bluegrass Beat - inched clr, held sway		2	\$11.20 \$5.80	
4 Skiffs Brewmeister - split horses, clear		9	\$5.00	
1 Burnt Bluff - dug in, gamely prevail		4	Ev. 402 60 Tmi. 4172	٥E
			Ex: \$83.60 Tri: \$173.	95
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003				
Report for Race # 3 at TP (CLM 5f 6100) on February 28,	2019			
Selections:	Results:			
9 Cherry Ganache - cruise control, clear		9	\$5.80 \$2.60 \$2.40	
8 Headfirst - rushed 3w 1/4, rallied		7	\$2.20 \$2.20	
7 Dhafeera (GB) - long drv, gave in late		8	\$2.80	
2 Rusty Halo - raced evenly, no bid		3		
			Ex: \$10.40 Tri: \$8.30	
Fuzzy's Hansa Dick's Convenight 2002				
Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 4 at TP (CLM 6½f 9000) on February 28	2010			
======================================		====		===
Selections:	Results:			
6 Gales of November - 3path turn, weakened		3	\$4.40 \$3.20 \$2.60	
3 Rulelikecleopatra - shuffled rail, rallied		4	\$6.00 \$3.20	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late		4 5		
		4	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late		4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late		4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining		4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	2019	4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining	2019	4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	2019	4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	2019 Results:	4 5 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70	0
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ====	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ====	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 ***********************************	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ===== 4 10 2	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ====	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$50	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ===== 4 10 2	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 ***********************************	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,		4 5 8 ===== 4 10 2	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$50	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid		4 5 8 ===== 4 10 2	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$50	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections:	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear,held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten -	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$6.20 \$4.60 \$10.2 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten - 7 Eternal Power - 3path 1/4, bid, hung	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$6.20 \$4.60 \$10.2 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten - 7 Eternal Power - 3path 1/4, bid, hung	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten - 7 Eternal Power - 3path 1/4, bid, hung 3 Albireo - 6path 1/4, improved Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003	Results: , 2019 Results:	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 \$5.40 \$3.40 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.8	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 \$5.40 \$3.40 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.8	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten - 7 Eternal Power - 3path 1/4, bid, hung 3 Albireo - 6path 1/4, improved Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at TP (CLM 6f 10200) on February 28, Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at TP (CLM 6f 10200) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 \$5.40 \$3.40 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.8	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, Selections: 9 Gunny Roo - off rail 1/4, faded 4 Get Tough - 3w-run, went clear 10 Time Traveller - awk/st, 3w-run, clear 7 Leo Meister - 6path turn, no bid Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 6 at TP (MDN 1m 10000) on February 28, Selections: 6 Unity - slow start, empty late 5 Aldo's Kitten - 7 Eternal Power - 3path 1/4, bid, hung 3 Albireo - 6path 1/4, improved Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 7 at TP (CLM 6f 10200) on February 28, Selections:	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5 5 1A	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5 5 1A 4	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.8	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5 5 1 A 4 7 7	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5 5 1A 4	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.00 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.80 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$3.40 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.80	
7 Alluring Approval - inched clear, held late 1 Accessorizing - rallied str, gaining Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003 Report for Race # 5 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28,	Results: , 2019	4 5 8 4 10 2 8 6 3 7 5 5 1 A 4 7 7	\$6.00 \$3.20 \$3.00 Ex: \$23.00 Tri: \$50.70 \$3.40 \$2.60 \$2.40 \$4.60 \$10.20 Ex: \$21.00 Tri: \$81.0 \$5.60 \$3.00 \$2.10 \$2.80 Ex: \$29.60 Tri: \$26.8	

Report for Rac	e # 8 at	TP (MDN	1m 18500)	on	February	28.	2019	

Selections: Results: Selections:

8 Stereo Viewing (IRE) - angled in,led,lost nod

2 Make Merry - 4w far turn,mild rally

7 She Be Striking (GB) - 3wd into str,wkened

6 St. Louise - chased, no match Ex: \$25.80 Tri: \$90.90

Fuzzy's Horse Pick's Copyright 2003
Report for Race # 9 at TP (CLM 1m 7100) on February 28, 2019

Selections: Results:

7 Haute Prospect - through after half,
Play for Play - bobbled, far back
Mileva - steadied fisrt turn 10 \$3.80 \$2.60 \$2.20 5 \$4.20 \$2.80 5 \$2.20

Ex: \$20.20 Tri: \$10.40